
Alverno Inferno heats up 

The Alverno Inferno has sparked 
to life and soon will be blazing. 
The Inferno is the name chosen 
for Alverno's new athletic teams. 
Basketball and volleyball will 
begin next fall, along with club 
soccer and softball. 

"Since this is the first year of our 
program, we can offer athletes an 
opportunity to be a part of history 
and get much more playing time 
than in an established program," 
said Athletic Director Sue Hansen. 
"But we're not going to be satis­
fied with just having five people 
in uniform. We are seeking real 
commitment from our athletes, 
and eventually expect to be com­
petitive. Why would we play if 
we don't intend to win?" 

Along with recruiting student ath­
letes, the college is hustling to 
raise funds for adequate athletic 
facilities. A major overhaul of 

Learning That Lasts 
Learning That Lasts, by Marcia 
Mentkowski and Associates, was 
published by Jossey-Bass in 
March. DraWing from two 
decades of longitudinal studies on 
student learning in the acclaimed 
curriculum at Alverno College 
and on leading educational 
theories - the authors present a 
portrait of deep and durable learn­
ing. 

• 
The book explores what it means 
for educators to foster essential 
skills for learning, leading, team­

, work and adapting with integrity 
in college and beyond. These 
same skills promote transforma­
tion of the learner. 

The authors draw on their own 
and others' experiences to develop 
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Alverno's sound but antiquated 
gymnasium began in March, and 
will be completed during the sum­
mer. Weight rooms and locker 
rooms also need renovation. 
Outdoor facilities, such as a soccer 
field, softball diamond and tennis 
courts, do not yet exist. 

"It's a big order," Hansen admit­
ted. "We have some students who 
are interested, but we are asking 
alumnae and friends and high 
school counselors to refer addi­
tional full-time student athletes. 
And, although we have received 
some seed money, we need much 
more if we are to provide the facil­
ities we need to be successful." 

Readers who can help or who 
would like additional information 
can contact Hansen at 414-382­
6323. Her e-mail address is 
sue.hansenla'alverno.edu. 

concrete suggestions for how fac­
ulty and academic staff can work 
together to forge effective curricu­
la, design innovative programs, 
implement key institutional goals, 
and renegotiate the college cul­
ture. 

Mentkowski is professor of psy­
chology and director of the Office 
of Educational Research and 
Evaluation at Alverno. Her associ­
ates are faculty, administrators 
and researchers, who span disci­
plines in the humanities, behav­
ioral sciences and the professions. 
The 450-page book is available for 
$38.95, plus shipping and han­
dling, from Jossey-Bass Publishers, 
350 Sansome St., San Francisco, 
CA 94104. It also can be pur­
chased on-line at Amazon.com. 

They're on 
their way! .~ "" 
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The 2000 edition of the Alverno 
College Alumnae Directory is 
nearing completion and soon the 
directories will be shipped. 

The all-new directory is a compi­
lation of the most current data 
available on over 10,000 Alverno 
College graduates worldwide. 
Information was obtained from 
questionnaire mailings. The 
Alverno Alumnae Directory can 
be used to help make new con­
tacts and get reacquainted with 
classmates and friends. 

All alumnae who reserved a copy 
of the directory may expect to 
receive their new edition in 
Spring 2000. If you have ques­
tions about your order, or if you 
wish to reserve a copy now, please 
contact the publisher directly at: 

Customer Service Department 
Bernard C. Harris Publishing Co. 
22 Koger Center 
Norfolk, VA 23502 

Phone: 1-800-877-6554 

E-mail: customerservice(a'bchar­
rispub.com 

To those who returned their ques­
tionnaires many thanks for your 
participation. And, to those who 
ordered a copy of the directory ­
enjoy! 

http:rispub.com
http:Amazon.com
http:sue.hansenla'alverno.edu
SHUTKISA
Typewritten Text
"Alverno Magazine," 
 Spring 2000




